## PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Office: 903.693.0333 Fax. 903.693.9366

;



314 W. Wellington Carthage, Texas 75633

Sheriff Kevin Lake

09 March 2017

HONORABLE COMMISSIONER'S COURT

Re: Food Bid

It is my recommendation the below listed companies be awarded contracts for food items for the 1 April 2017 through 30 September 2017 period.

Performance Food Service Flowers Foods

Respectfully,

Jina Confrauller,

Lt. Tina C. McMullen



# County of Panola

110 S. Sycamore • Room 216-A Carthage • Texas 75633 Phone 903-693-0391 • Fax 903-693-2726 County Judge Lee Ann Jones

County Commissioners Ronnie LaGrone, Pct #1 John Gradberg, Pct #2 Craig Lawless, Pct #3 Dale LaGrone, Pct #4

March 13, 2017

Ms. Debbie Davis Performance Food Group 4901 Asher Ave. Little Rock, Arkansas 72204

## **NOTIFICATION OF BID AWARD**

This is to notify you that your firm has been awarded a contract by the Panola County Commissioners' Court on March 13, 2017. The contract is for a period beginning April 1, 2017 and ending September 30, 2017

You have been awarded the bid for the following item(s) and/or service(s)

### **DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS/SERVICES**

**BID PRICE** 

Miscellaneous Food Items/Products (See Attached Bid)

As Bid

mes

March 13, 2017

DATE

## PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Office 903 693 0333 Fax. 903 693 9366



314 W Wellington Carthage Texas 75633

#### Sheriff Kevin Lake

February 14, 2017

Performance Food Group Attn: Debbie Davis 4901 Asher Ave. Little Rock, ARK 72204

Re<sup>+</sup> Bids for Food Items

The Panola County Detention Center is taking bids for food items. The attached contains food items that would be purchased during the next six months. Please note that the form is somewhat different. It is requested by the auditor's office that the item number, package size and type of good be listed and the bid list. I would appreciate a bid on any and all items/products that you sell. If you do not sell any of the items listed, please fill in "not applicable" in the cost column. All entries must be typed; electronic format is available upon request.

If you do not wish to submit a bid, please fax this letter back "No Bid Submitted" and your signature.

The items bid selected for purchase will be for a six month period, beginning April 01, 2017 through September 30,2017. It is understood that fresh produce, fresh meat products and fresh cheeses can only be predicted on a weekly basis.

The Pañola County Commissioners Court request I have the bids in hand by March 7, 2017 You may return by mail, email or hand deliver. Thank you in advance for your time and consideration.

lun

Lt. Tina C. McMullen, Jail Administrator Panola County Detention Center <u>Una.mcmuller, Groo panola 18 (18</u> 903-693-0359 X-266

Food Service Tustance COMPANY NAME

NO BID SUBMITTED **5ID SUBMITTED/SEE ATTACHED** 

Honesty, Integrity, Service

	F00	d Bid She	et		
	APRIL 1, 2017 1	hru Septe	mber 30, 2017		
Mi	ist use Excell Spreadsneet (Ty	(ped) and fi	Nin "all" inform	ation ""Electronic	
	File Can Be Seut For				
Pack Size	Description	Price	Item Number	·····	
6/#10	APPLESAUCE UNSWEETEND	\$28.01	228606	Pack/Size/Brand 6/#10CN /WEST CRK	
/15 LB	BACON BUFFET 18-22 L/O SLCD FZ			······································	
		\$55.02	339820	1/15 LB /SLVR SRC	
/5 LB /1 LB	BAKING PWDR BASE BEEF NO MSG ADDED TFF	\$53.21	955346	6/5 LB /CLBR GRL	
second and s		\$8.40	343185	1/1 LB /RDGCRST	
/1 LB	BASE CHICKEN NO MSG ADDED TFF	\$8.41	344063	1/1 LB /RDGCRST	
/5 OZ	BASIL LEAVES	\$6.75	242819	1/5 OZ /MCCRMCK	
/#10	BEAN BKD W/PORK	\$33.53	300679	6/#10 /WEST CRK	
/20 LB	BEAN GREAT NRTHRN	\$16 76	390349	1/20 LB /SLVR SRC	
/50 LB	BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN	\$24.89	870780	1/50 LB /PACKER	
/5LB AV	BEEF FOR STEW VP FZ	\$4.42	331766	2/5LB AV /PERF CM	
/10#AV	BEEF GRND FINE 80/20	\$2.02	976609	8/10#AV /IBP	
0/5 33oz	BEEF PATTY	\$29.29	158842	30/5.33 OZ/WEST CRK	
2/2 LB	BOLOGNA TURKEY 1 OZ SLCD FZ	\$41.09	532844	12/2 LB /BUTTERBL	
/ <u>5 LB</u>	BREAD CRUMBS PLN	\$25.50	938142	6/5 LB /IMPERIA	
/5 LB	BROWNIE MIX	\$26.42	43125	6/5 LB /HOSPTLTY	
2/4 OZ	BURRITO BEEF & BEAN RED CHILI	\$31.50	980465	72/4 OZ /LITTLE J	
/5 LB	CABBAGE SHRED SEP COLOR	\$12.25	880514	4/5 LB /PEAK	
/5 LB	CAKE MIX WHI	\$24.20	988774	6/5 LB /GILSTER	
/50 LB	CARROT BULK JUMBO	\$28.69	957915	1/50 LB /PACKER	
/#10	CARROT SLCD TFF	\$22.81	863495	6/#10 /WEST CRK	
/6 CT	CELERY FRSH	<u>1</u> \$14.75	867179	1/6 CT /PEAK	
/30 OZ	CELERY SALT NO MSG	\$10.22	56510	1/30 OZ /MCCRMCK	
/5 LB	CHEESE CHED FTHR SHRED R/F	\$47.79	235402	4/5 LB /CORAZO	
/10 LB	CHICKEN BRST RAND B/S MAR FZ	\$41.14	894678	4/10 LB /PACKER	
/10 LB	CHICKEN DICED WHI DARK 1/2" FC	\$36.94	859181	1/10 LB /KOCH	
/5LB AV	CHICKEN NUGGET	\$31.54	887415	1/10 LB /SLVR SRC	
/16 OZ	CHIP POTATO ORGNL RIDGED	\$20.29	861687	9/16 OZ /WEST CRK	
8/1 LB	COFFEE GRMT	\$71.80	946454	18/1 LB /S&D CFE	
14/1.5 OZ	COOKIE DGH CHOC CHIP	\$50.04	415962	214/1.50Z /HRTG OVN	
/350Z	CORN FLAKES	\$12.50	76240	4/35 OZ /HOSPTLTY	
/#10	CORN WHL KERNEL	\$23 64	863494	6/#10CN /WEST CRK	
8/4oz	CORN DOGS TURKEY	\$33.69	947908	48/4 OZ /STATE FR	
/1 GA	DRESSING RANCH TFF	\$35.63	201321	4/1 GA /SLVR SRC	
/1 GA	DRESSING SALAD TFF	\$17.94	201324	4/1 GA /SLVR SRC	
2/18 OZ	DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH TFF	\$21.61	326246	12/18 OZ /WEST CRK	
/15 DZ	EGG WHI MED GRD AA LOOSE	\$10.09	157471	1/15 DZ /WEST CRK	
/25 LB	FLOUR H&R AP	\$7.39	81983	1/25 LB /ROMA	
/5 LB	FRANKS 8/1 TURKEY FZ 6"	\$14.44	977511	2/5 LB /CAROLINA	
/5 LB	IFRIES 1/2 IN CC RTU TFF FZ	\$18.21	995552	6/5 LB /TATR PAL	
/3 LB /350Z	FROSTED FLAKES	\$10.21	76248	4/35 OZ /HOSPTLTY	
/32 OZ	GARLIC CHPD WATER TFF	\$14.44	370251	1/32 OZ /ROMA	
	GRAVY MIX BRWN			manager and state an	
/14 OZ	HAM BUFFET 35% SMKD	\$13.39	863118	6/14 OZ /SHWNEEML	
/10#AV		\$2.31	883832	2/10 AV /SLVR SRC	
/24ct		\$28,48	907437	1/24 CT /PEAK	
00/10 GM	JELLY VAR #10 CUP	\$14.82	194592	400/10 GM /WEST CRK	
0/4 OZ	JUICE ORANGE CARTON 100% FZ	\$13.83	969677	70/4 OZ /SUNCUP	

•

•

30/1 LB	MARGARINE SOLIDS	\$22.20	518672	30/1 LB /WEST CRK	
900/5 GM	MARGARINE SPREAD WHIPPED CUP	\$18.63	157455	900/5 GM /WEST CRK	
4/1 GA	MAYO HD	\$23.33	992166	4/1 GA /GMED SPI	
6/1 GA	MILK 2%	\$23.43	918678	6/1 GA /COLEMANS	
6/1 GA	MILK WHL	\$24.31	918679	6/1 GA /COLEMANS	
1/10 LB	MUSHROOM BUTTON SM	\$20.94	61368	1/10 LB /PACKER	
4/1 GA	MUSTARD PLAS RED BOY	\$10.94	128597	4/1 GA /CLMNT FD	
1/50 LB	OATS QUICK	\$27.47	73974	1/50 LB /GILSTER	
6/1 GA	OIL SOY SALAD TFF	\$37.70	897344	6/1 GA /WEST CRK	
1/10 LB	ONION YLW MED	\$5.63	954823	1/10 LB /PACKER	
6/5 LB	PANCAKE MIX BUTTERMILK	\$20.47	882914 982614	6/5 LB /HOSPTLTY 1/10 OZ /SPICE CL	
1/10 OZ	PARSLEY FLAKES	\$8.14			
2/5LB AV	PASTA EGG NOODLES 1/4"	\$16.80	251636	2/5 LB /ASSOLUTI	
1/20LB	PASTA SPAGHETTI	\$14.82	256747	2/10 LB /LUIGI	
6/5 LB	PEANUT BUTTER CRMY TFF	\$46.82	308156	6/5 LB /WEST CRK	
6/#10	PEAS & CARROT	\$34.42	158073	6/#10 /LIBBYS V	
1/20 LB	PEAS GRN IQF GRD B	\$22.23	993243	1/20 LB /SLVR SRC	
1/10 LB	PEPPER BLK GRND BULK	\$94.06	274688	1/10 LB /DELUNA	
1/18 OZ	PEPPER WHI GRND	\$23.53	242882	1/18 OZ /MCCRMCK	
5/#10	POTATO DICED	\$26.63	863489	6/#10 /WEST CRK	
1/50 LB	POTATO IDAHO RUSSET 100 CT TFF	\$16.63	908015	1/50 LB /PEAK	
6/#10	POTATO INST MASHED W/VITAMIN C	\$55.56	864225	6/#10CN /TRURECIP	
6/#10	POTATO YAM CUT TFF	\$32.10	863473	6/#10 /WEST CRK	
6/#10	PUDDING VANILLA	\$28.61	869306	6/#10 /SLVR SRC	
4/35OZ	RAISIN BRAN	\$15.50	76243	4/35 OZ /HOSPTLTY	
1/1 GA	RELISH SWEET TFF	\$9.50	528807	1/1 GA /WEST CRK	
4/35OZ	RICE CRISPIES	\$14.94	76242	4/35 OZ /HOSPTLTY	
1/50 LB	RICE LONG GRAIN 4% BROKEN POLY	\$17.67	194609	1/50 LB /WEST CRK	
1/25 LB	SALT IODIZED GRANULAR TFF	\$6.39	334001	1/25 LB /WEST CRK	
6/#10	SAUCE TOMATO CONC TFF	\$19.87	878209	6/#10 /WEST CRK	
1/50 LB	SHORTENING CAKE & ICING	\$33.97	525527	1/50 LB /BUNGE	
2/5 LB	SOUR CREAM GRD A HVY BODY TFF	\$14.37	201096	2/5 LB /WEST CRK	
1/50 LB	SUGAR GRANULATED EXTRA FINE IMP	\$24.58	303783	1/50 LB /SLVR SRC	
1/25 LB	SUGAR LIGHT BRWN	\$20.34	76683	1/25 LB /DIXIE CR	
200/1.5 OZ	SYRUP PANCAKE & WAFFLE CUP TFF	\$24.46	194587	200/1.5 OZ /WEST CRK	
32/3OZ	TEA AUTOBREW	\$22.22	907379	32/3 OZ /GUEST HS	
4/350Z	TOASTED OATS	\$14.44	76244	4/35 OZ /HOSPTLTY	
1/25 LB	TOMATO 5X6	\$22.06	878065	1/25 LB /PEAK	
6/#10	TOMATO DICED 3/4" IN JUICE TFF	\$20.21	878218	6/#10CN /WEST CRK	
6/#10	TROPICAL FRUIT SALAD	\$43.64	25855	6/#10 /DOLE	
2/9#AV	TURKEY BRST OVEN PREPARED SKNLS	\$2.63	891746	2/9#AV /SLVR SRC	
6/#10	VEGETABLES MIXED TFF	\$27.26	863483	6/#10CN /WEST CRK	
4/1 GA	VINEGAR WHI DISTILLED 40 GRAIN	\$11.21	273740	4/1 GA /WEST CRK	
4/96oz	MAC & CHEESE	\$33.51	874345	4/96 OZ /WEST CRK	
4/5lb	CHEESE AMER YLW 120 SL	\$43.71	158718	4/5 LB /WEST CRK	
3/10LB	ELBOW MACARONI ELBOW PASTA	\$29.01	251734	3/10 LB /ASSOLUTI	



## County of Panola

110 S. Sycamore • Room 216-A Carthage • Texas 75633 Phone 903-693-0391 • Fax 903-693-2726 County Judge Lee Ann Jones

County Commissioners Ronnie LaGrone, Pct #1 John Gradberg, Pct #2 Craig Lawless, Pct #3 Dale LaGrone, Pct #4

March 13, 2017

Mr. Ray Kırkland Flowers Baking Co of Tyler, LLC 1200 West Erwin Tyler, Texas 75702

### NOTIFICATION OF BID AWARD

This is to notify you that your firm has been awarded a contract by the Panola County Commissioners' Court on March 13, 2017 The contract is for a period beginning April 1, 2017 and ending September 30, 2017.

You have been awarded the bid for the following item(s) and/or service(s).

#### **DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS/SERVICES**

**BID PRICE** 

Bread (White Sandwich Bread,
Wheat Sandwich Bread, Hamburger Buns,
Hot Dog Buns, Honey Wheat Bread, 4 1/2"
Bulk SD, Won DNR RO,
4" Bulk Plain, Flowers Rolls
& Jumbo Sunbeam 4.5 in Buns

As Bid

mes COUNTY JUDG

<u>March 13, 2017</u> DATE

## PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Office: 903 693 0333 Fax: 903.693.9366



314 W. Wellington Carthage, Texas 75633

### Sheriff Kevin Lake

February 14, 2017

Flowers Foods 1200 W. Erwin Tyler, TX 75702

Re. Bids for Food Items

The Panola County Detention Center is taking bids for food items. The attached contains food items that would be purchased during the next six months. Please note that the form is somewhat different. It is requested by the auditor's office that the item number, package size and type of good be listed and the bid list. I would appreciate a bid on any and all items/products that you sell. If you do not sell any of the items listed, please fill in "not applicable" in the cost column. All entries must be typed; electronic format is available upon request.

If you do not wish to submit a bid, please fax this letter back "No Bid Submitted" and your signature.

It is understood that fresh produce, fresh meat products and fresh cheeses can only be predicted on a weekly basis.

The Panola County Commissioners Court request I have the bids in hand by March 7, 2017 You may return by mail, amail or hand deliver. Thank you in advance for your time and consideration.

ina cmm. De

Lt Tina C. McMullen, Jail Administrator Panola County Detention Center <u>time memory of panola terms</u> 903-693-0359 X-266

COMPANY NAME Towers Being Co of Tyler, LLC

NO BID SUBMITTED\_\_\_\_\_

BID SUBMITTED/SEE ATTACHED 🖌 🔏

Honesty, Integrity, Service

#### PANOLA COUNTY JAIL FOOD ITEMS BID SHEET APRIL 1, 2017 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2017

#### and the control of th

ITEM #	BRAND	PKG.SIZE	DESCRIPTION	PRICE
101-1038-0	BREAD	24 oz	White Sandwich Brood Texas Gian:	S 1.70 per loof
102-1880-0	BREAD	20 2/4 OZ	Wheat Sandwich Bread Honey Wheat The	\$1.80 per loa'
101-2376-0	BREAD	8 ct.	Hamburger Buns	\$1.49 рег рюд
101-2388-0	BREAD	8 ct.	Hot Dog Buns	\$1.49 per pkg
102-1508-0	BREAD	20 <b>24 oz</b>	Honey Whoat Dread Honey Wheat Split Top	S* #9 per loaf
100-2556-0	BREAD	4 1/2	Bulk SD 20 count	34 10 per pkg
ອ <b>11-2908-</b> ທ	BREAD	12 ct.	Won MOXING DNR RO	S1 49 per prog
169-2676-0	BREAD	30 ct.	4" Bulk Plain	📯 🥸 per µkg
100-2912-0	BREAD	24 ct.	Kiyskil Rolls Flowers	32.54 per pkp
101-2535-0	BREAD	8 ct.	NOSMIXJumbo Stubcam 4 1/2 .nch	5 1 99 per pkg

---- 02/23-2017 and -Ray Kirkland, VP of Sales

Flowers Baking Colof Tylor, LLC 1200 Wast Erwin Street Tylen Tx - 75702

903-595-242 - phone 903-535-7975 iaz

\*